
Subject: Re: Bills uploaded
From: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>
Date: 06/20/2017 01:24 PM
To: Robert Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org>, Marcus Lieber
<Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com>

See attached.

From: Robert Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org>
Date: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 at 1:20 PM
To: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>, Marcus Lieber <Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com>
Subject: RE: Bills uploaded

Got me!   Can you send out a scan of the bill?

Robert Buente

President/CEO

1010 Development Corporation

1001 South Hope Street

First Floor

Los Angeles, CA  90015

bbuente@1010dev.org <mailto:bbuente@1010dev.org>

213-749-0214 x202 (o)

213-749-3098 (f)

From: Ellen Riotto [mailto:ellen@southpark.la] 
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2017 12:48 PM
To: Marcus Lieber <Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com>
Cc: Robert Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org>
Subject: Bills uploaded

Hi Marcus,

FYI – bills have been uploaded to bill.com. Quick question for you – we received a bill 
from the county for an “unsecured property tax bill.” Looks like we’ve received and paid 
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these in the past. Can you fill me in on what this is exactly?

Thanks,

Ellen

Ellen Riotto 

Interim Executive Director

South Park Business Improvement District

1100 S Flower St, Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

ellen@southpark.la <mailto:ellen@southpark.la>  | o. 213 663 1112 | c. 401 439 8147

southpark.la <http://www.southpark.la/>  | Facebook <http://fb.com/SouthParkLosAngeles>  | 
Twitter <https://twitter.com/southparkla>  | Instagram <https://www.instagram.com
/southparkla/>
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